COUNTY OF ROCKLAND

Department of General Services
Purchasing Division

Contract Award Notification

Title: FUEL, UNLEADED

Contract Period: December 17, 2021 through December 14, 2023
Ext thru 12/14/24

Original Date of Issue: ~ December 14, 2021

Date of Revision: 06/28/23

S/C No: S/C PC69516

Catalog: Automobiles & Vehicles

Authorized Users: Rockland

Address Inquires To:

Robert Poole
Purchaser |
845-364-3808

845-364-3809
pooler@co.rockland.ny.us

Description
This contract is for Unleaded Fuel.

Contract # Vendor Number Contractor & Address Telephone No.
S/C PC69516 0000018745 Global Montello Group Corp. 781-398-4259
800 South Street
Waltham, MA 02454 Dispatch number:
Contact: Kevin Young 800-826-5686
smartbuydispatch@globalp.com

Fax: 781-398-9213
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Dept. of General Services
Purchasing Division

50 Sanatorium Rd

Bldg A, 6th FI, Room 609

POMONA NY 10970
www.rcpurchasing.com

Supplier 0000018745
Global Montello Group
Kevin Young

800 South Street
Waltham MA 02454

County of Rockland
CONTRACT

Dispatch via Print

Poole,Robert

Contract ID Page
S/C PC69516 lof 1
Contract Dates Currency
12/17/2021 to 12/14/2024 uUsbD
Contract Maximum

Fuel, Unleaded 1,100,000.00
Freight Terms Buyer Email

pooler@co.rockland.ny.us
Buyer Phone Fax

845/364-3808 845/364-3809

Phone 800/542-0778
Fax 781/398-9213
smartbuydispatch@globalp.com

Tax Exenpt ? Tax Exenpt |D:
Line# Supplier Item Item Desc Item ID Price UOoOM
1 GASOLINE - REGULAR UNLEADED 40515000001 1.00000 Dollar
2 GASOLINE - PREMIUM UNLEADED 40515000002 1.00000 Dollar
3 GASOLINE-Federal Hazardous Superfund Tax 40515000003 1.00000 Dollar

PRICES, TERMS AND CONDITIONS ARE IN ACCORDANCE WITH STATE CONTRACT S/C PC69516

Authorized Signature

*Puaéwm_




NEWYORK | Office of General Services
STATE OF

orroruny. | Procurement Services

Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | https://ogs.ny.gov/procurement | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Contract Award Notification Update

Subject: Contract Renewals

DATE: June 21, 2023 AWARD #: 23237 GROUP #: 05600
AWARD DESCRIPTION: Gasoline & E-85 (Statewide)
CONTRACT PERIOD: December 17, 2021 — December 13, 2024

CONTACT: Todd Kayser | 518-473-3252 | todd.kayser@ogs.ny.gov

CONTRACT NO.: CONTRACTOR: Buell Fuel, LLC
PC69515
PC69516 Global Montello Group Corp.
Goetz Energy Corp. dba Kurk Fuel Company

PC69517 Main Brothers Oil Co. d/b/a Main Care Energy
PC69518 N ; o
Mirabito Holdings, Inc. dba Mirabito Energy Products.
PC69519
MX Petroleum
PC69520
NOCO Energy Corp.
PC69521 ;
Sprague Operating Resources, LLC
PC69522 Sunoco, LLC
PC69523 ’

Please be advised that in accordance with the CONTRACT TERM AND EXTENSIONS clause, all the
contractors have extended their contracts for one year through December 13, 2024.

All other terms and conditions of the contract remain the same.

056000560023237p0505


https://online.ogs.ny.gov/purchase/spg/awards/0560023237CAN.HTM

NEWYORK | Office of General Services
STATE OF

oreoriun. | Procurement Services

Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | https://ogs.ny.gov/procurement | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Contract Award Notification Update

Subject: Federal Hazardous Substance Superfund Tax

DATE: January 20, 2023 AWARD #: 23237 GROUP #: 05600
AWARD DESCRIPTION: Gasoline & E-85 (Statewide)
CONTRACT PERIOD: December 17, 2021 — December 14, 2023

CONTACT: Todd Kayser |518-473-3252 | todd.kayser@ogs.ny.gov

CONTRACT NO.: CONTRACTOR: Buell Fuel, LLC

PC69515

Global Montello Group Corp.
PC69516

Goetz Energy Corp. dba Kurk Fuel Company
PC69517 ) X .

Main Brothers Qil Co. d/b/a Main Care Energy
PC69518 C ; o

Mirabito Holdings, Inc. dba Mirabito Energy Products.
PC69519

MX Petroleum
PC69520

NOCO Energy Corp.
PC69521 ;

Sprague Operating Resources, LLC
PC69522 Sunoco, LLC
PC69523 ’

Please be advised that the Inflation Reduction Act of 2022 reinstates the section 4611 Hazardous Substance
Superfund financing rate (petroleum Superfund tax rate) on domestic crude oil and imported petroleum
products, effective January 1, 2023.

As per the terms and conditions stated in Section 2.12 — Price, Contractors have the option of including the
after-imposed tax as a separate line item at the price per gallon listed below for the fuel type. The tax per gallon
was truncated to four decimal places from the 16.4 cents per barrel of the taxable fuel.

Fuel Type Superfund tax per gallon
Conventional Gasoline (Regular, Mid, Premium) S 0.0035
OPRG (E) Gasoline (Regular, Mid, Premium) S 0.0035
E-85 S 0.0005

Please note: Contractors may itemize fees, taxes, or other charges in an invoice, but the total price of the fuel
and itemized charges must be equal to or less than the OGS posted price. The Superfund tax is the only
allowable charge in addition to the total fuel price per gallon.

All other terms and conditions of the contract remain the same.

056000560023237p0404



NEWYORK | Office of General Services

STATE OF

oreorruny | Procurement Services

Coming Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | https://ogs.ny.gov/procurement | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Contract Award Notification

Group 05600 — Gasoline & E-85 (Statewide)

Title Classification Code(s): 15
Award Number 1 23237 (Replaces Awards 23092 & 23215)
Contract Period : December 17, 2021 — December 14, 2023
Bid Opening Date :  October 21, 2021
Date of Issue :  December 10, 2021
Specification Reference : As Incorporated Herein
Contractor Information : Appears on Pages 2 of this Award
Address Inquiries To:
State Agencies & Vendors Political Subdivisions & Others
Procurement Services
Name : Bryant Kirk Customer Services
Title - Contract Management Specialist 2
Phone @ 518-402-3021 Phone : 518-474-6717
E-mail : Bryant.Kirk@ogs.ny.gov E-mail :  customer.services@ogs.ny.gov

Procurement Services values your input.
Complete and return "Contract Performance Report" at end of document.

Description

The purpose of this Award is to provide Authorized Users with a means of acquiring various grades of
Gasoline and E-85 by bulk delivery to an Authorized User’s storage facility for use in the Authorized User’s
own pumps. The product shall be Contractor furnished, delivered and unloaded as specified herein.

For current contract prices, please go to the Pricing Information link on the Award page.

There are 0% SDVOB participation goals on this contract.
There are 0% MWBE participation goals on this contract.

Links to the base contract, current prices, updates, and delivery schedules are located on
the Award page at: http://www.0gs.ny.gov/purchase/spg/awards/0560023237CAN.HTM



GROUP 05600 — Gasoline & E-85 (Statewide)

PAGE 2

NOTE: See individual contract items to determine actual awardees.

Contract
Number

Contractor & Address

Contact Information

FEIN /
NYS Vendor
ID

PC69515
SB

Buell Fuel, LLC
2676 State Route 12B
Deansboro, NY 13328

Julia Brouillette

Contracts Manager
Phone: 315-841-3000
Email: Julia@buellfuel.com

Customer Service Contact for NYS Contract
Orders during Normal Business Hours:

M —F 7:30am - 4:30pm, Sat 8am — 12pm
Customer Service Representative

Phone: 315-841-3000

Email: info@buellfuel.com

Person to Contact to Escalate Contract Orders:
Al Buell

Lead Dispatcher

Phone: 315-841-3000

Email: Al@buellfuel.com

Contact for After Hours, Weekend/Holidays, or
NYS Declared Emergency:

Garth Curtis

Director of Bids & Supply

Phone: 315-841-3000

Cell: 315-404-3899

Email: Garth@buellfuel.com

Backup Contact for NYS Declared Emergencies
or Disasters (available throughout emergency):
Michael Buell

Owner

Phone: 315-841-3000

Cell: 315-941-9716

Email: MB@buellfuel.com

760826999
1000009690

PC69516

Global Montello Group Corp.

8000 South Street
Waltham, MA 02454

05600_23237a

Bid Department

Bid Personnel

Phone: 781-398-4003
Email: bids@globalp.com

Customer Service Contact for NYS Contract
Orders during Normal Business Hours:
24/7/365

Dispatch Department

Dispatch Personnel

Toll-Free: 800-826-5686

Email: smartbuydispatch@globalp.com

Contact for After Hours, Weekend/Holidays, or
NYS Declared Emergency:

Dispatch Department

Toll-Free: 800-826-5686

Email: smartbuydispatch@globalp.com

043443028
1100005467




GROUP 05600 — Gasoline & E-85 (Statewide)

PAGE 3

Backup Contact for NYS Declared Emergencies
or Disasters (available throughout emergency):
Mark Romaine

Chief Operating Officer

Phone: 781-398-4003

Email: MRomaine@globalp.com

PC69517 | Goetz Energy Corp. dba Kurk Fuel
Company
1319 Military Road

Buffalo, NY 14217

Mary Burke

Fuels Account Manager
Phone: 716-824-1298

Email: MBurke@kurkfuel.com

Customer Service Contact for NYS Contract
Orders during Normal Business Hours:

M-F 8am-5pm

Mary Burke

Fuels Account Manager

Phone: 716-824-1298

Email: MBurke@kurkfuel.com

Contact for After Hours, Weekend/Holidays, or
NYS Declared Emergency:

Mary Burke

Fuels Account Manager

Phone: 716-824-1298

Cell: 716-867-9547

Email: MBurke@kurkfuel.com

Backup Contact for NYS Declared Emergencies
or Disasters (available throughout emergency):
Mike Asher

Dispatch

Phone: 716-876-4324

Cell: 716-480-3316

Email: customerservice@goetzenergy.com

160450990
1000007438

Main Brothers Oil Co. Inc dba
Main Care Energy

1 Booth Lane

Albany, NY 12205

PC69518

Accepts NYS Purchasing Card for
orders up to and including
$50,000

05600_23237a

Greg Childs

Vice President

Phone: 800-542-5552

Email: GChilds@maincareenergy.com

Customer Service Contact for NYS Contract
Orders during Normal Business Hours:

24 Hours, 7 days a week

Customer Service

Phone: 800-542-5552

Email: customercare@maincareenergy.com

Contact for After Hours, Weekend/Holidays, or
NYS Declared Emergency:

Greg Childs

Vice President

Phone: 800-542-5552

Cell: 518-365-7105

Email: GChilds@maincareenergy.com

146024844
1000007301




GROUP 05600 - Gasoline & E-85 (Statewide) PAGE 10
Montgomery | Gas Regular $2.3425 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Montgomery | Gas Mid Range $2.4480 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Nassau Flex Fuel (E-85) $2.5586 $0.0000 Global Montello
Nassau OPRG (E) Gas Regular $2.3242 $0.0000 Sprague Operating
Nassau OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range $2.3850 $0.0000 Sprague Operating
Nassau OPRG (E) Gas Premium $2.4458 $0.0000 Sprague Operating
New York OPRG (E) Gas Premium $2.8419 $0.0000 Global Montello
Niagara Gas Regular $2.3487 $0.0100 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel
Niagara Gas Mid Range $2.5320 $0.0000 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel
Niagara Gas Premium $2.6537 $0.0000 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel
Oneida Gas Regular $2.5215 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Oneida Gas Mid Range $2.6959 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Onondaga Flex Fuel (E-85) No Bid N/A N/A
Onondaga Gas Regular $2.5402 $0.0000 Mirabito Energy
Ontario Gas Regular No Bid N/A N/A
Ontario Gas Mid Range No Bid N/A N/A
Ontario Gas Premium No Bid N/A N/A
Orange Flex Fuel (E-85) $2.5737 $0.0000 Global Montello
Orange OPRG (E) Gas Regular $2.5167 $0.0000 Global Montello
Orange OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range | $2.5626 $0.0000 Global Montello
Orange OPRG (E) Gas Premium $2.5884 $0.0000 Global Montello
Orleans Flex Fuel (E-85) No Bid N/A N/A
Orleans Gas Regular $2.3752 $0.0500 Goetz dba Kurk Fuel
Oswego Flex Fuel (E-85) No Bid N/A N/A
Oswego Gas Regular $2.5397 $0.0650 NOCO Energy
Oswego Gas Mid Range $2.6175 $0.0650 NOCO Energy
Otsego Gas Regular $2.4692 $0.0000 Buell Fuel
Putnam OPRG (E) Gas Regular $2.5105 $0.0000 Global Montello
Putnam OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range | $2.5564 $0.0000 Global Montello
Putnam OPRG (E) Gas Premium $2.6422 $0.0000 Global Montello
Queens OPRG (E) Gas Regular $2.3744 $0.0000 Sprague Operating
Queens OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range | $2.4352 $0.0000 Sprague Operating
Queens OPRG (E) Gas Premium $2.4960 $0.0000 Sprague Operating
Rensselaer Flex Fuel (E-85) $2.5432 $0.0000 Global Montello
Rensselaer Gas Regular $2.3753 $0.0000 Global Montello
Rensselaer Gas Mid Range $2.4373 $0.0000 Global Montello
Richmond OPRG (E) Gas Regular No Bid N/A N/A
Rockland Flex Fuel (E-85) $2.5614 $0.0000 Global Montello
Rockland OPRG (E) Gas Regular $2.5044 $0.0000 Global Montello
Rockland OPRG (E) Gas Mid Range | $2.5503 $0.0000 Global Montello
Rockland OPRG (E) Gas Premium $2.6361 $0.0000 Global Montello
Saratoga Gas Regular $2.4216 $0.0000 Global Montello
Saratoga Gas Mid Range $2.4936 $0.0000 Global Montello
Saratoga Gas Premium $2.6576 $0.0000 Global Montello
Schenectady | Gas Regular $2.4248 $0.0000 Global Montello

05600_23237a
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